Winter Abrasives and Road Salt
Bid #21-0930WA Bid Tabulation

Mileage Hauling
Round Cost
Trip Bid Price Per Ton Total Cost Per Ton
Type Z
Type 1 Type 1 | Coke-Ash Type 2 Type 3
Item A Item B Bottom Type 1 Item| Type 1 Coke-Ash Road Salt
Type 1, 2| #10 Stone | #9 Stone Ash Type3 | Typel,2 | A #10 |ltem B #9(Bottom Ash| Type3 Delivered
Location &3 Dust Dust Anti Skid | Road Salt &3 Stone Dust | Stone Dust | Anti Skid | Road Salt | by Vendor
George's Creek Qakland 75 $20.35 $20.35 No Bid No Bid $11.00 $31.35 $31.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accident 64 $20.35 $20.35 No Bid No Bid $9.38 $29.73 $29.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 30 $20.35 $20.35 No Bid | No Bid $4.40 $24.75 $24.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Keystone Lime - Eichorn Oakland 53 $20.45 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $7.77 $28.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accident 15 $20.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.20 $22.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 16 $20.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.34 $22.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Keystone Lime - Cranesville Oakland 38 $18.57 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $5.57 $24.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accident 30 $18.57 NoBid | NoBid [ NoBid | $4.40 $22.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 50 $18.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.33 $25.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maryland Minerals Qakland 11 $19.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.61 $21.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accident 28 $19.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.10 $23.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 53 $19.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.77 $27.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fairfax Concrete - Petersburg, WV Qakland 95 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $13.93 No Bid $31.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accident 148 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $21.71 No Bid $39.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 159 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $23.32 No Bid $41.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Allegany Aggregates - Flintstone, MD Qakland 119 No Bid $16.25 No Bid No Bid $17.45 No Bid $33.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accident 87 No Bid $16.25 No Bid No Bid $12.76 No Bid $29.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 62 No Bid $16.25 No Bid No Bid $9.09 No Bid $25.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Belmont Aggregates Qakland 143 No Bid No Bid $8.25 No Bid $20.97 No Bid No Bid $29.22 No Bid No Bid
Morgantown, WV Accident 92 No Bid No Bid $8.25 NoBid | $13.49 No Bid No Bid $21.74 No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 113 No Bid No Bid $8.25 No Bid $16.57 No Bid No Bid $24.82 No Bid No Bid
Laurel Aggregates Oakland 108 No Bid No Bid $15.00 NoBid | $15.84 No Bid No Bid $30.84 No Bid No Bid
Morgantown, WV Accident 80 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid $11.73 No Bid No Bid $26.73 No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 102 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid | $14.96 No Bid No Bid $29.96 No Bid No Bid
Cargill, Inc. - Baltimore, MD Qakland 372 No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.35 $54.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid $143.91 $90.35
Accident 352 No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.35 $51.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.98 $90.35
Grantsville 326 No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.35 $47.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.16 $90.35
Government Mlo Supplies Oakland 382 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $80.00 $56.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid $136.03 $102.00
Baltimore, MD Accident 350 No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $51.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $131.33 $102.00
Grantsville 324 No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $47.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.53 $102.00






