Winter Abrasives and Road Salt
Bid #24-0919W Bid Tabulation

Mileage Hauling
Round Cost
Trip Bid Price Per Ton Total Cost Per Ton
Iype 2
Type 1 Type 1 | Coke-Ash Type 2
Item A Item B Bottom Type 1 Item| Type 1 Coke-Ash
Type 1 | #10 Stone | #9 Stone Ash Type3 |Typel & [ A #10 |Item B #9|Bottom Ash
Location &2 Dust Dust Anti Skid | Road Salt 2 Stone Dust | Stone Dust | Anti Skid
George's Creek Oakland 75 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $11.00 $31.00 $31.00 No Bid
Accident 64 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $9.38 $29.38 $29.38 No Bid
Grantsville 30 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $24.40 $24.40 No Bid
Keystone Lime - Eichorn Oakland 53 $24.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.78 $32.43 No Bid No Bid
Accident 15 $24.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.20 $26.85 No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 16 $24.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.34 $26.99 No Bid No Bid
Keystone Lime - Cranesville QOakland 38 $21.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.57 $27.12 No Bid No Bid
Accident 30 $21.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.40 $25.95 No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 50 $21.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.33 $28.88 No Bid No Bid
Maryland Minerals QOakland 11 $23.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.61 $24.86 No Bid No Bid
Accident 28 $23.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.10 $27.35 No Bid No Bid
Grantsville 53 $23.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.77 $31.02 No Bid No Bid
Allegany Aggregates, Inc. Oakland 119 No Bid $17.00 NoBid | NoBid | $17.45 No Bid $34.45 No Bid
Accident 87 No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $12.76 No Bid $29.76 No Bid
Grantsville 62 No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $9.09 No Bid $26.09 No Bid
Fairfax Concrete Products Qakland 95 No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid $13.93 No Bid $32.43 No Bid
Petersburg Accident 148 No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid $21.71 No Bid $40.21 No Bid
Grantsville 159 No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid $23.32 No Bid $41.82 No Bid
Arcosa Aggregates Oakland 108 No Bid No Bid $12.00 NoBid | $15.84 No Bid No Bid $27.84
Lake Lynn, PA Accident 79 No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid $11.59 No Bid No Bid $23.59
Grantsville 101 No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid $14.81 No Bid No Bid $26.81
Belmont Aggretates Qakland 143 No Bid No Bid $10.50 No Bid $20.97 No Bid No Bid $31.47
Maidsville, WV Accident 92 No Bid No Bid $10.50 No Bid $13.49 No Bid No Bid $23.99
Grantsville 113 No Bid No Bid $10.50 No Bid $16.57 No Bid No Bid $27.07
Cargill, Inc. - Elkins, WV Oakland N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid | $105.54 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accident N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid | $105.54 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid | $105.54 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. Qakland N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid | $110.97 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Elizabeth, PA Accident N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid | $110.97 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid | $110.97 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
Government MLO Supplies USA Oakland N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.76 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
Baltimore, MD Accident N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.76 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grantsville N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.76 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid
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